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Planning Applications Registered by Tendring District Council 
 

Week ending 19th July 2024 

 

 
PARISH 
APPLICATION NO. 
APPLICANT 
 

 
PROPOSAL 

 
LOCATION 
 

 
ALRESFORD 

  

 
24/01024/FULHH 
Mr David Gowans 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Proposed extension and repositioning 
of garage approved under 
23/00934/FUL. 
 

 
Grange Lodge 
Wivenhoe Road 
Alresford 
Colchester 
Essex 
CO7 8BG 
 

 
24/01032/FULHH 
Mr Edwards 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Proposed single storey side extension, 
privacy fence, replacement garage 
and wider driveway. 
 

 
5 Station Road 
Alresford 
Essex 
CO7 8BS 

 
ARDLEIGH 

 
 

 

 
24/00885/FUL 
Mr Simon Patrick Earl 
 

 
Planning Application - Proposed 
retention of 2no. existing portacabin 
containers and installation of an 
additional 2no. portacabin containers 
(4 units in total). 
 

 
Total Roofing Supplies 
Old Ipswich Road 
Ardleigh 
Essex 
CO7 7QL 

 
BEAUMONT 

 
 

 

 
24/00926/FULHH 
Ms Joanna Selt 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Continuous use of outbuilding as an 
annex. 
 

 
Hollands Farm 
Beaumont Road 
Great Oakley 
Harwich 
Essex 
CO12 5BH 
 

 
BRADFIELD 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
BRIGHTLINGSEA 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
CLACTON 

 
 

 

 
24/00889/OUT 
Mr Carpenter 
 

 
Outline Planning Application (all 
matters reserved) - one new dwelling. 
 

 
5 Sheppard Close 
Clacton On Sea 
Essex 
CO16 8YA 

https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGCMY6QB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGEEGMQB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SF2PVFQB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFKRJ2QB0RE00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SF87QPQB0RE00
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24/00933/FUL 
Mr Andrew Harper - Tendring 
District Scouts 
 

 
Planning Application - over sheet to 
existing roof in order to secure and 
protect the structure below. 
 

 
Clacton Scout Headquarters 
Valley Road 
Clacton On Sea 
Essex 
CO15 6NA 
 

 
24/00934/FUL 
Standard Securities Ltd 
 

 
Planning Application - External 
alterations involving replacement 
cladding at fifth floor level and removal 
of brise soleil on front elevation. 
 

 
Jackson House 
45 Jackson Road 
Clacton On Sea 
Essex 
CO15 1JA 
 

 
24/01043/FULHH 
Mr and Mrs Smith 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Proposed single storey rear extension 
with 2 No. velux rooflights, relocation 
of front entrance door, replace 
(previous front door area) with 
window. 
 

 
23 Bromley Close 
Clacton On Sea 
Essex 
CO16 7HZ 

 
ELMSTEAD 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
FRATING 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
FRINTON & WALTON 

 
 

 

 
24/00968/FULHH 
Mrs Pamela Graham 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Front porch. 
 

 
44 Greenway 
Frinton On Sea 
Essex 
CO13 9AL 
 

 
24/01030/FULHH 
Mrs Rachel Curtis 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
New single storey wrap around side 
and rear extension with a partial first 
floor side extension. New entrance 
porch. 
 

 
Rose Cottage 
19 Chapel Lane 
Kirby Cross 
Essex 
CO13 0NF 

 
GREAT BENTLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
GREAT BROMLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
GREAT OAKLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
HARWICH 

 
 

 

 
24/00931/FULHH 

 
Householder Planning Application - 

 
19 Deanes Close 

https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFMMMKQB0RE00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFMNRYQB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGNST8QB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFXVG2QB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGD1OXQB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFL54MQB0RE00
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Sabastian Lever 
 

Erection of 7ft high fence. 
 

Dovercourt 
Harwich 
Essex 
CO12 4JH 

 
 
LAWFORD 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
LITTLE BENTLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
LITTLE BROMLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
LITTLE CLACTON 

 
 

 

 
24/01051/FULHH 
Susanna Barker 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Single storey side extension and 
garage conversion (replacing garage 
door with window and door). 
 

 
5 Village Close 
Little Clacton 
Essex 
CO16 9RF 

 
LITTLE OAKLEY 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
MANNINGTREE 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
MISTLEY 

 
 

 

 
24/00866/FULHH 
Mr B Smith 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
Proposed replacement fence to front 
elevation. 
 

 
10 New Road 
Mistley 
Manningtree 
Essex 
CO11 2AG 

 
RAMSEY & PARKESTON 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
ST OSYTH 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
TENDRING 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
THORPE LE SOKEN 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
THORRINGTON 

 
None Received  
 

 

 
WEELEY 

 

None Received  
 
 

 

   

https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGO9L5QB0OT00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SEYV0AQB0OT00
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WIX  
 
24/01033/FULHH 
Mr Alistair Forbes 
 

 
Householder Planning Application - 
detached garage to side of property 
(following removal of existing garage). 

 
Lynfield 
Bradfield Road 
Wix 
Manningtree 
Essex 
CO11 2SL 

 
WRABNESS 

 
 

 

 
24/00961/LUEX 
Mr Glenn Lockey 
 

 
Application for Lawful Development 
Certificate for Existing Use or 
Development for Class A - caravan 
used for occasional overnight stay 
within permitted development. 
 

 
Land to The South of 
Wall Lane 
Wrabness 
Essex 
CO11 2BB 

 

https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SGEEWWQB0RE00
https://idox.tendringdc.gov.uk/online-applications/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=SFSCRZQB0OT00

